ORDER: ACCEPT GENERAL BIDS

Motion was made by David Rikard, duly seconded by Chad McLarty. to accept
general bids as attached .

The vote on the motion was as follows:

Supervisor Kevin Frye. voted ves
Supervisor Jeff Busby. voted yes
Supervisor David Rikard. voted yes
Supervisor Chad McLarty, voted yes
Supervisor Mike Roberts. voted yes

After the vote, President Busby, declared the motion carried, this the 5" day of
July, 2016.

Sherry Wallk ancery Clerk




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

LANN Chemical Panola all american poly columbus paper
Price/Case Pkg Style Price Price Qry Price Oty Price
Can Liners
30"x36" - black 25.67/cs 250/¢s 17.75  250fcs | 5 19.42 250/cs
36"x58" - black 18.99 100/cs 15.25 100/cs | S 15.01 100/cs 14.95| 100/cs
38"x60"-Orange 30.59 100/cs 3795 200/cs | $ 29.16 100/cs
Gloves
Med/Lg 40.6 10/100/cs 25.2 10/100/cs 43.33| 10/100/cs
XL 40.6 10/100/cs 25.2 10/100/cs 43.33| 16/100/cs
Toilet Tissue _ **must specify sheets per rol|**
2-ply med grade 28.63 96/500/cs 25.25  96/cs 30.5| 96/cs
2-ply jumbo rolf 16.412/1000/cs 164  12/cs 15.85| 12/cs
2-ply Angel Soft 43.85 80/450/cs 52.9 80/cs
Paper Towels
Brown Multifold 1645  4000/cs 14.29 4000/cs 15.92] 4000/cs
2-ply household kitchen roll 18.2 30/cs 17.15 30/cs 18.36| 30/cs
Disinfectants
Disinfectant Spray 36.72 12/cs 24.8 12/cs 38.54[ 12/cs
Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner 32.16 12/cs 23.4 12/cs 33.26| 12/cs
Glass Cleaner
Gal. Windex Brand Glass Cleaner 40.36 afcs 37.95 4/cs 44.72| 4/cs
Mops & Handles
24 oz Screw type Rayon mop head {without band) CH&B |7.10/ea, 85.2/cs 12/cs |63.60/cs 12/cs 56.04| 12/cs
32 0z Screw type Rayon mop head (without band) CH&B 7.8/ea, 93.6/cs 12/cs 84.25 12/cs 69.48| 12/cs
60" Layflat janitor Handles 5.00/ea 4,55 each 39.56| 12/cs
54" Layftat Janitar Handles 3.80/ea 3.5 ea 37.56[ 12/cs

Miscellaneous




Box Rags-White 19.33/cs 10lhs 27.25 brick no bid

4-1/2 oz R/R Cone Cups 45.05/cs 5000/cs 38.4 5000/cs 59.48| 5000/cs
12 oz Foam Cups 24.85/cs 1000/cs 2479 1000Q/cs 32.95| 1000/cs
8 oz Foam Cups 18.54/cs 1000/cs 17.39 1000/cs 19.03| 1000/cs
Furniture Polish, Lemon Shine Up, 17.7 oz 48.00/cs 12/cs 27.8 12/cs 32.32] 12/cs
Shelia Shine, 100z - Stainless Steel Cleaner 63.50/cs 10/cs 639 12/10:z 49.53] 12/cs
White Nylon Hand Held Scrub Brush 6.30/ea 2.45 each no bid
Taoilet seat dispensers 8.50/eq 4.5 each 1471 ea
Toilet seat covers 21.20/cs 2500/cs 10.4 1000/cs 69.95| 5000/cs
Toilet Brush RM6310 2.56/ea 2.3 each 63.6| 24/cs
Feather duster 7.23/ea :al feathers 7.75 each no bid

Replacement Duster Heads 8.35/ea ho bid

Nifty Grabber 23.90/ea 23.35 each 150.78| 6/cs
Multifold Paper Towe| Holder 26.2/ea 26.95 no bid

Lobby Dust Pans 10.20/ea 9.1 12.55 ea
Scrub Brushes 2.95/ea 4.49

Urinal Blocks 9.00/cs 12/cs 79.55
Stoko Soap 50.46/cs 6/cs 7.75 each
Gojo Wall Dispenser's 16.85/ea 15.95

Deodorizers

24 oz Cherry Wall Deodorant Block 27.48/cs 6/cs 26.2 6/box
Air Freshener Aerosol 160z 37.08/cs 12/c¢s 29.4 12/cs 36.7| 12/cs
Soap

tiquid Lotion Soap for Dispensers 37.80/cs 12/cs 16.69 4 no bid

Dial Brand Antibacterial Hand Soap, Gal 47.20/cs 4fcs 42.75 4 49.6| 4/cs
Estesol Gold Liquid Antibactertal Hand Soap, 2000 m| | 67.50/cs 6/cs 66.9 6/cs no
Golo Hand Cleaner 66.00/cs 4/cs 73.95 6/cs no
Dial indivual Size hand soap 7.5 oz item #BX0761 12/cs 30.36/cs 12/cs 70.5 1000/cs 32.34| 12/cs
Floor Care
26 qt Combo Mop Unit w/bucket & wringer 50.25/ea 41.4 5ct 35.23 ea
5"x36" Dust Mop Heads {generic brand) 7.00/ea 12/cs 63 12/cs 111.48] 12/cs
5"x36" Dust Mop Heads {rubbermaid brand) 17.40/ea 12/cs 2474 12/cs 247.68| 12/cs
5"x24" Dust Mop Heads {generic brand) 6.5/ea 12/cs 47.75 12/cs 77.16{ 12/cs




5"x24" Dust Mop Heads {rubbermaid brand) 13.45/ea 12/cs 185.5 12/cs 196.44) 12/cs
Dust Mop Handles 7.25/ea 6.75 each 174,96 12/cs
Snapback Spray Buff, gallon 84.00/cs 4fcs 79.5 4
Vacuum bags for NSS Pacer 25.85/pkg 10/pkg 15.95 10 pk
Paper filter bags 25.85/pkg 10/pkg 15.95 10 pk
24" bust Mop cover 6.50/ea 12/cs 47.75 12/cs

36" Dust Mop cover 7.00/ea 12/cs 63 12/cs
320z Spray Bottles .65/ea 042 each 45| 100/cs
Spray Nozzles .58/ea 0.49 each 59| 100/cs
Carpet Freshener 45.64/cs 9/cs 26.25 12/cs no bid
Straw Bulldog Brooms 22 oz 6.60/ea 12/bundle 42,6 12fes 76.321 12/cs
Floor Sealer, gal 13.00/ea 4fcs 9.75 gal 43.84| 12/¢s
Floor Finish, gal 11.00/ea 4fcs 9.75 gal 44.8| 12/cs
A/H Carpet & Room Deodorizer, 42.6 oz 45.64/cs 9/cs 36.15 S/cs
CSR-Plus Carpet Spot & Stain Remover, gts 53.52/cs i2/cs 36.5 6/cs
Dust Off Dust Mop Treatment Aerosol, 14 oz 38.40/cs 12/cs 339 12fes
20" White Floor Polish Pads 15.5/cs S/es 14.7 5/cs 16.95| 5/cs
20" Black Flaor Stripping Pads 15.5/cs 5/cs 14.7 5/cs 16.95( 5/¢cs
20" Red Buff Pads 15.520/cs 5/cs 14.7 5/cs 16.95{ 5/cs
Stride Citrus Floor Cleaner 28.44/cs 4/cs 25.3 4fcs 23.8| 4/cs
Tile & Grout Restorer 39.84/cs 12/cs 29.3 12/cs 33.26| 12/cs
Straw Brooms 6.60/ea 12/bundle 42.6 12/cs 76.32| 12/cs
Cleaners
Liquid Bleach, gal 10.38/cs 6/cs 6.28 afcs 11.26| 6/cs
Comet Cleanser w/bleach, 32 oz 43.60/cs 8/cs 42.25 8/cs
Powder Comet, 21 oz 33.60/cs 24/cs 31.15 24/cs 19.45| 24/cs
Laundry Products - LANN CHEMICAL ONLY
5 Gal Breaker HD 86 5 gal 47.85
5 Gal Liquid Laundry Bleach 55 5 gal 34.65
5 Gal Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent 155 5 gal 65.05
5 Gal Iron Removing Sour 124 5 gal 43.1
5 Gal. Breaker HD 86 5 gal 47.85
Residual Insecticide Crawling nsect Kifler, 15 oz 57.24 12/cs 43 12/cs




Flying Insect Spray, 16 oz 61.8 12/cs 35.88 12/cs

Pro Exterminator Wasp/Hornet Spray, 17.5 oz 44.4 12/cs 33.98 12/cs 41.18] 12/cs
3.8# Fire Ant Killer, granular 6.25/ea 132 12/cs

Laundry Products - LANN CHEMICAL ONLY

5 Gal Breaker HD 86 47.85

5 Gal Liguid Laundry Bieach 55 34.65

5 Gal Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent 155 65.05

5 Gal lron Removing Sour 124 43.1




Polyethylene Culvert Pipe and Couplings

Coburns, G&O, Consolidated Pipe & Supply and Williams Equip
Coupling  Smooth Int Pipe

m:

HO:

HN!

H.m:

H.m:

24"

wo:

Wm:

42"

48"

54"

mo:

Corrugated Pipe

$4.51
$4.88
$6.65
$9.27
$15.62
$21.74
$28.34
$38.86

$46.49

$91.46

$8.86
$10.00
$16.66
$28.39
$40.04
$93.08
$129.50
$189.55

$222.51

$346.13

$4.51
$4.88
$6.65
$9.27
$15.62
$21.74
$28.34
$38.86

$46.49

$91.46

Coupling

$8.86
$10.00
$16.66
$28.39
$40.04
$93.08
$129.50
$189.55

$222.51

$346.13




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016 Huggins Ol
Qty/units Price Price per gal/pd

Oil, Grease, Anti-freeze, transmission fluid

0Oil-5w20, Chevron Supreme bulk 7.70/gal

Chevron Delo 400-30 3/lgallons | S 39.70

Chevron Ursa Super Plus EC 15w40 bulk 8.00/gal

Chevron Ultra Duty Grease 10/14 tubes 24.95/pkg

Chevron Ultra Duty Grease 1/35 pail 92.45/pkg

Prem Tractor Hydraulic Fluid bulk S 6.20

ATF Dexron i} 12/1 gts $ 2520

Multi-Vehicle 6/1 qts S  21.90

Synthetic Gear Lube 50w 1/5 pails S 91.80

Synthetic Gear Lube 75W 1/5 pails S 91.80

Gear Lube-85W140 1/5 pails S 43.80

Anti-Freeze 1/55drums | $ 41880 ¢ 7.61

Anti-Freeze 6/1 gal $ 5650 % 9.42

Anti-Freeze Green 1/55drums | $ 39270 7.14

Anti-Freeze Green 6/1 gal $ 4350( $ 7.25

Dex Cool Extended tife

Dex Cool Extended Life 6/1 gal 49.6

Purple Power Degreaser 1/55drums | § 237.50

Shell ELC 1/55drums | $ 660.00




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Specialty Sales

55 gal Fleet Wash 1/55 gal drum $ 190.00
55 Gal Truck Wash 1/55 gaf drum S 180.00
5 Gal Truck Wash 5 Gallon $  35.00
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Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Heavy Equip G&O
Qty/units Price

Grader Blades

1/2" x 6" x 6' Double Beveled $  39.00 $ 4950
1/2" x 6" x 7' Double Beveled $ 4550 S 57.75
1/2" x 6" x 8 Double Beveled S 52,00 S 66.00
1/2" x 6" x 9' Double Beveled S 5850 S 74.25
1/2" x 6" x 10" Double Beveled S 6500 5 8250
1/2" x 8" x 6' Double Beveled $ 5820 3  68.10
1/2" x 8" x 7' Doubie Beveled S  67.90 S 7945
1/2" x 8" x 8 Double Beveled S 77.60 S 90.80
1/2" x 8" x 9' Double Beveled S 87.30 S 102.15
5/8"x6" 8.10/ft 9.75/if
5/8"x8" 11.35/ft 13.45/If
Grade 8 bolts with nuts 5/8" x 2", 2-1/2", 3" 1.08,1.18, 1.30 s 1.84
Grade 8 bolts with nuts 3/4" x 2", 2-1/2", 3" 1.40,1.54, 1.78 S 2.10




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Ergon
CRS-2 1.8601/gal
CRS-2P 2.1503/gal

Freight




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Nunley trucking

Qty/units

Price

Hauling Rock

Hauling Rock

15.95/ton




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Rock Hoover, Inc
Qty/units Price
Product
Rip Rap - RR100, RR200, RR300 11.00/ton
#89 11.69/ton
#67 10.35/ton
#56 10.35/ton
Crusher Run 10.35/ton.
#57 Wash 10.35/ton
#1 Wash Rock 10.35/ton
Pit run clay gravel
3/4" base 10.35/ton
#2 unwashed
#7 washed 11.35/ton

Qversize clean

Pea gravel

concrete sand

fill sand

mason sand




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

memphis stone and

\

Rock Evans gravel tillatobia smith broths
Qty/units Price Qty/units Price Qty/units Price

Product

Oversize Gravel 26.00/ton 18.35 14.50/ton

o]

Clay Gravel 13.50/ton 4.05 7

#57 Wash (Shaker Run) $25.00/ton 15.00 14.50/ton

#1 Wash Rock {3")

Pea Gravel $26.00/ton 17.30 14.50/ton

Mason Sand $20.50/ton 9,00/ton

Concrete Sand 3.75 4,00/ton

Fill Sand 12.00/ton 3.00 2.00/ton




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

G&0 Coburns
Qty/units Price Qty/Units Price
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 12" $ 8.00 S 792
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 15" $ 9.60 $ 950
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 18" $  12.00 $ 11.88
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 21" $ 13.60 $ 13.46
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 24" $ 15.20 $ 15.05
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 30" $  19.20 S 19.01
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 36" S 2341 $ 2296
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 42" S 28.56 $ 28.27
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 16 GA 48" $ 3192 $ 3159
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 12" $ 9.60 5 9.50
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 15" $  12.00 S 11.88
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 18" S 1440 $ 14.25
2-2/3 x1/2 Galv 14 GA 21" $  16.80 $ 16.63
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 24" $  19.20 $ 19.01
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 30" $  24.00 $ 23.76
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 36" $ 28.80 $ 28.51
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 42" $ 35.28 $ 34.92
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 48" $ 4032 $ 39.91
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 14 GA 54" $ 4536 $ 4490
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 15" $ 16.80 5 16.63
2-2/3x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 18" $  20.00 $ 19.80
2-2/3x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 21" S 23.20 S 2296
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 24" $  26.40 $ 26.13
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 30" S 32.80 $ 3247
2-2/3x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 36" $ 3920 S 38.80
2-2/3x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 42" $ 47.88 S 47.39
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 48" S 5461 S 54.05
2-2/3x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 54" $ 61.32 $ 60.70
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 60" $  71.28 $ 7056
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 12 GA 66" $ 7832 $ 7752




2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 18"

$ 24.80 $ 2455
2-2/3 x1/2 Galv10 GA 21" $ 28.80 $ 2851
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 24" S  32.80 S 32.47
2-2/3 x 12 Galv 10 GA 30" $ 4160 $ 4118
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 36" S  49.60 5 49.10
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 42" S  60.48 $ 59.87
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 48" $ 68.89 $ 6818
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 54" s 77.28 $ 76.50
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 60" $  90.64 $ 89.72
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 66" S 99.44 S 98.43
2-2/3 x 1/2 Galv 10 GA 72" S 112.17 $111.04
3 x 1 Galv 16 GA 358" $  26.40 $ 26.10
3x1Galvi1sGA 42" S 3276 S 32.40
3 x 1Galv16 GA 48" S  36.96 S 36.56
3 x1Galv 16 GA 54" $  42.00 S 41.54
3 x 1 Galv 16 GA 60" $  48.40 $ 47.88
3 x 1 Galv 16 GA 66" $ 52.80 $ 52.21
3 x1 Galv 16 GA 72" $  60.19 $ 59,53
3 x1 Galv 16 GA 78" $ 64.75 $ 64.04
3 x 1 Galv 16 GA 84" $ 70.23 S 69.46
3 x1 Galv 16 GA 90" $ 7478 $ 73.97
3 x1Galv 16 GA 96" $  79.34 S 78.49
3x1Galv 14 GA 36" S 32.80 S 32.44
3x1 Galv14 GA 42" $ 39438 $ 39.04
3 x1 Galv 14 GA 48" $ 45.36 S 44.87
3x1 Galv14 GA 54" $ 51.24 $ 50.69
3x1 Galv14 GA 60" $ 58696 $ 58.34
3x1Galv14 GA 66" $  65.12 $ 64.41
3x1Galv14GA 72" $ 73.88 S 73.08
3x1Galv14 GA 78" $  79.34 $ 78.49
3 x 1 Galv 14 GA 84" $ 8572 $ 8478
3 x 1 Galv 14 GA 90" $  91.20 $ 90.22
3 x 1 Galv 14 GA 96" 5 97.58 $ 96.54
3 x1 Galv 14 GA 102" $ 103.97 5102.86




3 x1Galv 14 GA 108 $ 109.44 $108.27
3x1Galv14 GA 114" $ 115.83 $114.60
3 x 1 Galv14 GA 120" $ 139.36 $137.90
3 x1 Galv 12 GA 36" $ 4480 $ 4432
3x1Galv12 GA 42" $ 5461 $ 54.02
3 x1Galv 12 GA 48" $  62.16 $ 61.50
3 x 1 Galv 12 GA 54" $ 69.72 $ 68.99
3 x 1 Galv 12 GA 60" S 80.96 $ 80.11
3 x1 Galv 12 GA 66" S 83.88 $ 87.93
3 x1Galv12 GA 72" $ 100.32 $ 9925
3 x1Galv12 GA 78" $ 108.52 $107.37
3 x1Galv12 GA 84" S 116.74 $115.50
3 x 1 Galv12 GA 90" $ 12494 $123.63
3x1Galv12 GA 96" S 134.06 $132.65
3 x 1 Galv 12 GA 102" $ 141.36 $139.88
3 x 1 Galv 12 GA 108 $ 150.48 $ 148.90
3 x1Galv12 GA 114" $ 158.69 $157.03
3 x1Galv 12 GA 120" $ 190.32 $188.34
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 36" $ 56.80 $ 56.19
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 42" $ 6972 $ 68.99
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 48" $  79.81 $ 78.96
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 53" S 89.04 $ 88.10
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 60" $ 103.84 $102.75
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 66" $ 113.52 $112.32
3 x1Galv 10 GA 72" $ 127.68 $126.34
3x1Galv 10 GA 78" $ 138.63 $137.17
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 84" S 149.57 $148.00
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 90" $ 159.60 $157.93
3 x1Galv 10 GA 96" $ 171.46 $169.67
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 102" S 180.57 $178.69
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 108 $ 192.43 $190.43
3 x1 Galv 10 GA 114" $ 202.46 $200.36
3 x 1 Galv 10 GA 120" S 243,36 $240.84




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Vulcan Custom Product G&C

Posts/Signs/Numbers
Qty/units Price Qty/units Price Qty/units  Price

2# Green Posts
8' S 1257 50 § 490.50 5 9.52
9' S 1414 50{§ 725.00 $10.62
10' S 1572 50{ $ 613.00 $11.80
11' $  17.29 50{ $ 886.00 $12.98
12 $ 18.86 5005 735.50 $14.16
2# Galvanized Posts
g $ 15.29 50| $ 643.50 $12.40
9' $ 17.20 50| $1,163.50 $13.95
10’ $ 19.11 50| $ 804.50 $15.50
11 $ 21,02 50| $1,144.50 $17.05
12 S 2293 50/ $ 965.00 $ 18.60
Numbers
8" Series "D", Yellow, P/S, Numbers S 26.54 25| $  75.00 25| $22.50
Signs
12x12 S 4.07 $ 5.24 $ 3.95
12x6 S 2.87 $ 3.00 S 3.25
12%12 S 4,07 S 5.24 S 395
12x18 S 5.60 3 6.44 S 5.50
18x6 S 3.28 [ 4,25 $ 3.90
18x18 S 8.38 S 9.80 $ 8.30
18x24 S 11.19 S 1219 $10.25
24x8 S 5.44 S 5.73 $ 7.30
24x10 $ 6.76 5 7.15 $ 875




24x12 $ 7.91 $  10.03 $10.09
24x24 S 1492 S 16.24 $15.12
24x24 Oct $ 1459 $  16.24 $14.80
24x30 $ 1865 $ 2023 $ 19.00
24x36 $ 2238 $  23.55 $22.68
30x30 § 2331 §  24.59 $23.60
30x30 Oct § 2243 $ 2348 $21.50
30x30 circle 5 2376 $ 2459 52375
36x36 $  33.57 $ 3505 $34.02
36x36 Oct S 3172 $ 3391 $31.50
24x24 CRM, Blue On Side $ 1676 10| § 22.51 $16.20
24x24 CRM, Biue & Yellow Border 5 2064 10|85 2832 $17.80
cap S 3.25 100| $ 250.00 $ 2.90
Cross $ 3.65 100( $ 250.00 $ 3.30
5/16" x 2" hex bolt zinc S 0.20 100/ §  35.00 S 0.0
5/16" x 2" hex nut zinc S 0.08 100 S 12.00 S 0.03
5/16" x 2" washer zinc S 0.07 100 § 12.00 S 0.04
* Minimum order for FOB shipping 5 250.00 $  300.00 5 -
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Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Cold Mix Inc

Qty/units

Price

Cold Mix

Cold Mix

80.00/ton




Lafayette County Bid Number 315-06/24/2016

Striping Paint G&C

Qaty Price

White |gal 72/5 gal

Yellow |gal 569/ 5 gal




2X4
2X6
2X8

X4
3IX6
1X4
X6
6X6

1X¥
1X8
6X8
EXE

2X 10
IX0
4 X 10
&6 X 10
£X 10
[{EX 10

2X12
3X12
4X 12
6 X 12
8§ X 12
00X 12
12X12

6X 14
12X 14

6 X 16

723.00
730.00
750.00

690.00
690.00
673.00
6900
GH0L00

G300
G23.00
GO0}
62500

725.00
63000
O30
63000
600,00
6U0.00

£85.00
795.00
795.00
§50.00
850.00
850.00
£75.00

[025.00
1025.00

[075.00

773.00
BIS.00

775,00
813.00

125 0
200,00
700 .00
T (K

80300
R(35.00
80300
805 (0
803 00
803.00

Q23 00
925.00
92300
925.00
9235.00
925.00
975.00

8G0.00
855.00

800.00
855.00

775.00
730.00
750,00
730,00

&35.00
§35.00
R33.00
835.00
B53.00
835.00

975.00
975.00
975,00
975.00
975.00
975.00
[025.00

1050.00 1100.00
[050.00 t100.00

L0000 1125.00

ALL LUMBER #2 GRADE OR BETTER
TREATED .60 CCA FOR IN GROUND AND WATER CONTACT
THE ABOVE RATES ARE PER MBF F.0.8 FULTON, MS

925.00
935.00

825.00
800.00
800.00
804,00

905.0¢
905.00
20500
905.00
903.00
905.00

1050.00
1050.00
1050.00
1050.00
1050.00
1050.00
1100.00

1125.00
1125.00

1175.00

975.00
975.00

875.00
850.00
850.00
85000

953.00
935.00
933.00
955.00
9535.00
935.00

1100.00
L100.00
1100.00
[100.00
1100.00
1100.00
L150.00

1125.00
1125.00

1225.00

1030.00

985.00
985.00
98300

1125.00
17508

1360.00
1300.00

1275.00

H235.00 117500

H35.00 1085 00
035,00 [1OR5.00
[035.00 108500

[250.00 1325.00

1325.00 1425.00

FREIGHT WILL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE OF $400 de per Inele




